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Instructions: Thank you for being a recommender for the PCAFPD scholarship. Recommendations are
used as part of the selection process. Please type your information below and provide a digital copy to
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Recommender Information

Name: ESPERANZA A. TABILOG Relationship to applicant: Teacher-Adviser

Organization/School: SSLG, Sabang National High School Email address: esperanza.tabilog@deped.gov.ph

Applicant Information: Use additional pages as needed

Name: ALJAMAR RAHIM L. AVILA Current School: Sabang National High School

Recommendation

I am pleased to formally recommend Aljamar Rahim Avila for your esteemed scholarship program. In the
2023-2024 academic year, Aljamar held the position of Supreme Secondary Learner’s president at Sabang
National High School. Throughout this time, he has demonstrated exceptional dedication to his academic
pursuits and extracurricular activities, showcasing strong leadership, unwavering commitment, and a
profound sense of responsibility.

Aljamar has consistently showcased his leadership skills through his role in the student government. He
has effectively organized events that foster community spirit, engaged fellow students in meaningful
discussions, and advocated for their needs and concerns. His ability to collaborate with peers and faculty
alike has made a significant impact on our school environment, encouraging a culture of inclusivity and
respect.

Academically, Aljamar excels in his studies, maintaining a high GPA while participating in various
extracurricular activities such as one of the School Paper writers. His commitment to learning is evident
in his proactive approach to his education, often going beyond the curriculum to deepen his
understanding of subjects. Aljamar’s analytical skills and critical thinking abilities set him apart as a top
student in his class last school year in Grade 11.

Moreover, Aljamar’s involvement in community service initiatives reflects his character and dedication to
making a positive difference. Aljamar led clean-up drives and environmental projects at Sabang National
High School, organizing activities like litter collection, tree planting, and awareness campaigns. These
initiatives aimed to improve the school's surroundings, promote sustainability, and educate students
about environmental responsibility.

In conclusion, I strongly believe that Aljamar Rahim Avila is a deserving candidate for your scholarship.
His remarkable leadership qualities, academic achievements, and commitment to community service
make him an exemplary representative of our school. I am confident that he will continue to excel and
make meaningful contributions in his future endeavors.

Thank you for considering his application. Please feel free to contact me if you need any further
information.


